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Noble Membranes

For more than 50 years, Noble Company has pioneered the 
use of sheet membranes in the tile and stone industry. 
NobleSeal brand sheet membranes (TS, CIS, SIS, Noble 
Deck) and Chloraloy have a core 
layer which consists of Chlorinated Polyethylene (CPE), an 
inherently flexible elastomeric sheet guaranteed not to rot, 
crack, or deteriorate 
due to microorganisms. 
Sheet membranes are available for waterproofing, crack 
isolation, joint bridging, and sound reduction. Noble sheet 
membranes save time, money, are easy to install, and 
provide quality solutions to prevent costly failures. All Noble 
Company sheet membranes are made in the U.S.A. In 
2020, Noble Company added a liquid waterproofing 
membrane to its offering to complement its sheet 
membranes.























Noble
• Adhesives
• Sealants
• Seamers

Products that bring out the best in Noble Company 
membrane, drain, and foam product installations. 
NobleSealant provides for seaming and sealing of 
membranes, niches, or drains, while NobleSealant 250 
offers a practical method for sealing of wall joints and 
transitions in an AquaBlue installation. NobleBond EXT 
offers a high-strength, water-resistant bond in  NobleSeal 
sheet membrane installations. These accessory products 
have stood the test of time and are used in some of the 
world’s most prestigious projects and developments.















Noble Installation 
Accessories

Noble Installation Accessory items address the most 
challenging installation requirements. Thin-Line corners 
minimize build up and provide a timely method to address 
waterproofing concerns at corners and changes of planes. 
The patented NobleFlex and NobleFlex SD offer a simple 
solution to transition to a drain. AquaSeal accessories are 
designed to complete a liquid waterproof membrane 
installation.















Noble
• Niches
• Benches
• Curbs

Adding storage space within a shower environment is 
becoming more common. Noble Company has the solution 
with the industries’ widest range of preformed, waterproof, 
ready to tile niches. Custom sizes and configurations can 
be accommodated through special order. Within the shower 
space, add one of many different shapes and 
configurations to increase comfort and utility. Benches can 
be installed during the installation process or into an 
existing shower to add space for seating, shaving, or 
storage.









Noble
• Slopes
• Bases
It all starts with a solid foundation. Pro-Slope has a long-
standing legacy as the go-to pre-slope product for a full 
mortar bed installation. 
ProBase II shower base system from Noble Company 
provides the industry’s greatest impact resistant surface to 
accommodate code approved slope to drain. ProBase II is 
available in either a single-slope for use with a linear drain 
and large format tile or multi-slope for a point drain and 
smaller format tile solutions. ProBase II can also be 
customized to fit any configuration.













Noble 
Drains

The FreeStyle Linear Drain offers contemporary styling with 
a selection of seven drain lengths with four brushed 
stainless steel strainer styles as well as a tile-top strainer. 
The single pitch slope to drain allows for the use of large 
format tiles to complement the floor system used in the dry 
area. A barrier-free design can be achieved by resting the 
drain body on the integral flanges. Noble Company 
FreeStyle Linear Drains can be customized to meet project 
design requirements.
The FreeStyle Thin-Bed Drain is a proprietary drain 
introduced by the Noble Company in 2020, designed 
primarily to be used with Noble’s ProBase II Multi-Slope 
shower system. However, it can be used on its own, and 
does offer accessory items to transition to challenging 
installation requirements. Its low-profile strainer head allows 
for simple adaption to a barrier-free installation.
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